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MICROCONTROLLER DESIGN STANDARD TUTORIAL

paperback. Book Condition: New. Ship out in 2 business day, And Fast shipping, Free Tracking number will be
provided a=er the shipment.Pages Number: 311 Publisher: Beijing University of Posts and Telecommunications
Press Pub. Date: 2008-03 This book is the National Information Technology Training project - hardware
engineer career education program. the supporting materials. Microcontroller book for courses in colleges and
universities with the current theory and practice of teaching electrical engineering project development
engineer requirements for single-chip gap. focusing on about 51 single-chip design of the basic resources.
resources to extend the design. the design of input and output devices. input and output channels design.
hardware and so=ware development skills and experience. while at the end of the book compared with the 5l
chip introduced the AVR microcontroller latest Mega48 microcontroller theory and applications. The book is
divided into eight chapters. including an overview of the microcontroller and embedded systems. 51 single-chip
design of internal resources. 51 single-chip resources to extend the design. the design of commonly used input
and output devices. input and output channels of the design. development. environment and development and
debugging methods. common hardware and so=ware design skills and debugging techniques. Mega48
microcontroller theory and applications and so on. This tutorial emphasizes the basic concepts and practical
application of the combination of knowledge-engineering to master. so that readers learn that depth. caused
the school to use. Can be used as SCM system developers and college automation. electronics. computers.
precision instrument. machinery and other related professional school students in single-chip materials can be
used as SCM system development and electronic design enthusiasts and self-reference information. More
Contents: Chapter 1 Overview 1.1 Microcontroller and Embedded Systems 1.2 single-chip microcontroller and
embedded system characteristics. applications and market trends 1.3 Performance Comparison and Selection
of the mainstream chip used 1.4...
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